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This book explores cutting-edge research on the discovery and
application of marine bioactive molecules for biomedical and
pharmacotherapeutic purposes. The book begins by delving into the
bioprospection of marine sponge microbiomes for bioactive
metabolites using advanced metagenomics tools. It then explores
metagenome mining approaches for the discovery of marine microbial
natural products. The use of marine-derived fungi as a source of
anticancer secondary metabolites is also discussed. The book then
turns to the biomedical applications of marine-derived biomaterials,
including marine biopolymers in tissue engineering and regenerative
medicine. Marine-derived pharmaceuticals and polymeric
nanostructures for cancer treatment are also examined. Next, the book
looks at the use of marine microbial sources for the synthesis of
metallic nanomaterials, prospects, current development, and challenges
in nanomedicine. The book continues by exploring the treasure trove of
natural polymers for tissue engineering in the marine environment. It
also discusses the immunomodulatory and therapeutic potential of
marine-derived astaxanthin, current developments, and prospects.
Finally, the book concludes by exploring the recent progress in marine-
derived nutraceuticals and marine phytoplankton bioactive compounds
and their applications in medicine.
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