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One of the most devastating periods in twentieth-century history was
the rule of Pol Pot and the Khmer Rouge over Cambodia. From April
1975 to the beginning of the Vietnamese occupation in late December
1978, the country underwent perhaps the most violent and far-
reaching of all modern revolutions. These six essays search for what
can be explained in the ultimately inexplicable evils perpetrated by the
Khmer Rouge. Accompanying them is a photo essay that provides
shocking visual evidence of the tragedy of Cambodia's autogenocide.
""The most important examination of the subject so far.... Wi
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We are pleased to welcome you to the eleventh edition of the
Middleware conference. The program this year is a sign of the
robustness, activity, and continued growth of the Middleware
community. As computing technology around us has evolved rapidly
over the past decade, our notions of middleware have also adapted so
that we stay focused on the most challenging and relevant problems for
the present and future. As a result, this year’s program features papers
that belong to both traditional areas as well as new directions. Cloud
computing, social middleware, and transactional memory are some of
the vanguard areas that you will find in this year’s selection of papers.
In addition, topics that have always been central to the community are
also prominent this year, including publish-subscribe, multi-cast,
reliability, legacy, location-awareness, trust, and security. The
community’s wise evolution reflects the dynamic role that middleware
continues to play in the development of current software systems. The
program underscores the competitive selection process applied by us
and the technical program committee: out of 116 papers submitted this
year, we accepted 18 for regular publication. In addition Middleware
2010 also includes a new category of “Big Ideas Papers,” which are bold
white papers with the potential to drive longer-term innovation in the
field. We selected one “big ideas” paper this year. Our industrial track
once again brings forth papers that explore middleware foundations in
the context of industrial practice. Finally, multiple workshops and a
doctoral symposium round o? Middleware this year, making it an
attractive conference for students, faculty, researchers, and
practitioners.


