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Drawing from progressive educational thought, this guide helps
teachers translate theory into classroom practice in seven crucial areas,
including developing communities of learners, planning instruction,
and more.
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This pioneering new title has been conceived to provide users and
producers of tourism statistics, and those interested in labour statistics
in general, with a consolidated volume on the measurement of
employment in the tourism sector.
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'Dynamics of Human and Primate Societies' presents the most up-to-
date research in the study of human and primate societies,
demonstrating recent advances in software and algorithms for
modelling societies. It also addresses case studies that have applied
agent-based modelling approaches in archaeology, cultural
anthropology, primatology and sociology.
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Jewishness in Russian Culture is devoted to new approaches and
methods for the study of Jewish acculturation in Russian literature and
its effects. It attempts to redefine criteria and borders of a discipline
situated roughly between Judaica Rossica and Rossica Judaica. The
monograph describes a series of important literary Russian-Jewish
cultural events and figures belonging synchronically or diachronically to
both disciplines. Thus it unites within a new conceptual framework the
data accumulated by scholars and disciplines that exist separately in
different research spaces that do not overlap, Jewish Studies and the
history of Russian culture. The emerging picture shows the
development of a historical plot along the axis of acculturation and
anti-Semitism, accepting and/or trying to be accepted, being rejected
and/or rejecting, and being within or without.


