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Because of its exceptional electronic and optoelectronic properties,
graphene has the potential to become an important material in next-
generation electronic and energy applications. This authoritative
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volume discusses the synthesis, properties, and potential applications
of graphene, including in electronic, sensor, energy, and display
technologies. Suitable for researchers and graduate students, it
provides a cohesive, critical review of graphene nanoscience and
technology, offering valuable insight into how this material is made and
used--
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This volume of ""Studies in Health Technology and Informatics - User
Centred Networked Health Care - Proceedings of MIE 2011"" -
contributes to the discussion of the unresolved challenges arising for
21-century health care. It highlights a number of design issues and
explores experiences of health professionals and patients working and
living in ICT enabled environments. This ties into the Scandinavian
tradition of ICT development; to actively involve users in all aspects of
the design and implementation of complex technology in the
workplace. The book covers a broad range of methodological an
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This book presents selected papers from the 18th International
Conference on Intelligent Information Hiding and Multimedia Signal
Processing, in conjunction with the 15th International Conference on
Frontiers of Information Technology, Applications, and Tools, held on
December 16–18, 2022, in Kitakyushu, Japan. It is divided into two
volumes and discusses latest research outcomes in the field of
information technology (IT) including but not limited to information
hiding, multimedia signal processing, big data, data mining,
bioinformatics, database, industrial and internet of things, and their
applications.


