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Sommario/riassunto The so-called data deluge, along with ever-increasing technological
capabilities, tantalizes geographers with exciting opportunities for
spatial data analysis. These opportunities come with challenges,
because data and technology, alone, cannot address the pressing
questions of our world. Spatial analysis, a.k.a. spatial statistics, is a lot
more than colourful maps and attractive displays: still relatively
underrepresented in the Italian geography, this discipline has grown
from a strictly quantitative niche to part of a critical spatial science and
continues to stimulate new developments in statistics because, as we
know, spatial is special. This book, published in the series “New
Geographies. Work Tools”, adds spatial analysis to the Italian
geographer’s toolbox. Not a how-to manual, it presents some of the
core analytical issues through the redundancy of narrative language
and mathematical language. It traces the journey of spatial analysis
from its roots in quantitative geography, GIS, and statistics, towards
the definition of its own identity and the acceptance of its own relativity
and limitations. It discusses the relationship of spatial analysis with
GIScience and its efforts to embed critiques within its own discourse,
emphasizing the role of theory, the importance of hypothesis testing,
and acknowledging the ethics surrounding the use and analysis of data.
A few examples illustrate practical implementations, showing the value
added by spatial statistics in yielding reliable analyses that can support
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management decisions. It concludes with a brief outlook on the Italian
geographic literature, where spatial analysis – like elsewhere – can play
a role in competently accepting today’s opportunities and challenges,
in a constructive dialogue within geography as a whole.


