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This book analyses the state of development of Muslims at the regional
level. It explains the linkages between the findings of global, national,
and state-level studies with regard to the current status of Muslims and
broadens understanding of Muslims and their participation in virtually
all major sectors, including the economy, housing, demography, health,
migration, state policy, and affirmative action. The book presents the
challenges faced by the community and reflects upon the socio-
economic and educational conditions of Muslims in Telangana State. It
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presents a comparative analysis of mortality data, maternal health,
delivery care, and child immunization, as well as reproductive health
aspects and children’s nutritional status. It shares valuable insights into
the impacts of emigration and internal migration on health among local
Muslims and presents a detailed analysis of data from the Census of
India, NSSO, and Commission of Inquiry on Socio-Economic and
Educational Status of Muslims regarding the social, economic, and
demographic situation of Muslims in Telangana, as well as their
opportunities for development under the newly formed state
government. The book would be of great interest to scholars and
researchers in development economics, sociology, politics, history,
cultural studies, minority studies, Islamic studies, and policy studies, as
well as policymakers, civil society activists, and those working in media
and journalism.


