
UNINA99104183544033211. Record Nr.

Titolo The limits of art : on borderline cases of artworks and their aesthetic
properties / / Jiri Benovsky

Pubbl/distr/stampa Springer Nature, 2021
Cham, Switzerland : , : Springer Nature Switzerland AG : , : imprint :
Springer, , [2021]
©2021

ISBN 3-030-54795-7

Descrizione fisica 1 online resource (ix, 57 pages) : illustrations; digital, PDF file(s)

Collana SpringerBriefs in Philosophy, , 2211-4548

Disciplina 146.4

Soggetti Analysis (Philosophy)
Aesthetics
Analytic Philosophy
Fine Arts

Lingua di pubblicazione Inglese

Formato

Livello bibliografico

Nota di bibliografia

Nota di contenuto

Includes bibliographical references.

Sommario/riassunto

Introduction: Different types of limits -- Extending the limits I: Non-
visual and non-auditory artworks -- Extending the limits II: Intellectual
artworks -- Limits and their vagueness: The case of paintings and
photographs.
This open access book is about exploring interesting borderline cases
of art. It discusses the cases of gustatory and olfactory artworks
(focusing on food), proprioceptive artworks (dance, martial arts, and
rock climbing qua proprioceptive experiences), intellectual artworks
(philosophical and scientific theories), as well as the vague limits
between painting and photography. The book focuses on the author’s
research about what counts as art and what does not, as well as on the
nature of these limits. Overall, the author defends a very inclusive view,
'extending' the limits of art, and he argues for its virtues. Some of the
limits discussed concern our senses (our different perceptual
modalities), some concern vagueness and fuzzy boundaries between
different types of works of art, some concern the amount of human
intention and intervention in the process of creation of an artwork, and
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some concern the border between art and science. In these various
ways, by understanding better such borderline cases, Benovsky
suggests that we get a better grip on an understanding of the nature of
art.


