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This book is intended for researchers who are interested in
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investigating the nanomechanical properties of materials using
advanced instrumentation techniques. The chapters of the book are
written in an easy-to-follow format, just like solved examples. The
book comprehensively covers a broad range of materials such as
polymers, ceramics, hybrids, biomaterials, metal oxides, nanoparticles,
minerals, carbon nanotubes and welded joints. Each chapter describes
the application of techniques on the selected material and also
mentions the methodology adopted for the extraction of information
from the raw data. This is a unique book in which both equipment
manufacturers and equipment users have contributed chapters. Novices
will learn the techniques directly from the inventors and senior
researchers will gain in-depth information on the new technologies that
are suitable for advanced analysis. On the one hand, fundamental
concepts that are needed to understand the nanomechanical behavior
of materials is included in the introductory part of the book. On the
other hand, dedicated chapters describe the utilization of advanced
numerical modeling in understanding the properties of complex
materials. This book is useful for students and researchers from diverse
backgrounds including chemistry, physics, materials science &
engineering, biotechnology and biomedical engineering. It is well
suited as a textbook for students and as a reference book for
researchers.


