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On August 21, 2013, chemical weapons were unleashed on the civilian
population in Syria, killing another 1,400 people in a civil war that had
already claimed the lives of more than 140,000. As is all too often the
case, the innocent found themselves victims of a violent struggle for
political power. Such events are why human rights activists have long
pressed for institutions such as the International Criminal Court (ICC) to
investigate and prosecute some of the world's most severe crimes:
genocide, war crimes, and crimes against humanity.While proponents
extol the creation of the ICC as a transformative victory for principles of
international humanitarian law, critics have often characterized it as
either irrelevant or dangerous in a world dominated by power politics.
Christopher Rudolph argues in Power and Principle that both
perspectives are extreme. In contrast to prevailing scholarship, he
shows how the interplay between power politics and international
humanitarian law have shaped the institutional development of

Autore Rudolph Christopher <1966->

Materiale a stampa

Monografia



international criminal courts from Nuremberg to the ICC. Rudolph
identifies the factors that drove the creation of international criminal
courts, explains the politics behind their institutional design, and
investigates the behavior of the ICC. Through the development and
empirical testing of several theoretical frameworks, Power and Principle
helps us better understand the factors that resulted in the emergence
of international criminal courts and helps us determine the broader
implications of their presence in society.


