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Sommario/riassunto Notions of authenticity lie at the heart of many questions about
heritage and identity in the built environment. These questions are
most pertinent when buildings have been destroyed in disaster or war,
and the built fabric is being reconstructed to reinstate traditional or
historic appearances in place of what was lost.

Authentic Reconstruction examines this idea of reconstruction, using it
as a prompt to examine a range of deeper issues on heritage and the
built environment. From post-WWII reconstruction programmes
through to the rebuilding of historic cultural landscapes lost in natural
disasters, this collection of essays by heritage specialists provides a
wide range of case-studies and discussions. Each presents responses
to crises and lessons learned, in order to extrapolate general guidelines
for future actions by politicians, architects and planners in
reconstructing buildings.

The book also looks beyond disaster and war, noting how authenticity
bears on political intentions and image building, exploring how
reconstruction is used to tell a political or historical story, so
conditioning the ways in which the built environment is perceived and
appreciated by its users. This is not just about the buildings as bricks
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and mortar, but about perceptions of identity and the social and
historical values which buildings and spaces embody for a richly diverse
population.

This book will be valuable to all who are concerned with heritage as
practitioners or consumers, particularly those concerned with
reconstruction and the creation of authentic places and experiences:
architects, architectural historians, town planners, preservationists,
conservationists, and those involved in heritage management and
material culture.


